PUBLIC NOTICE - Notice Is Hereby Given That the Tangipahoa Parish Council Will Meet in <u>Regular Session</u> on Monday, July 13, 2020 Immediately Following the Public Hearing Held At 5:30 PM At Tangipahoa Parish Government Building, 206 East Mulberry Street, Amite, Louisiana, contact number (985) 748-3211

PUBLIC HEARING - Notice Is Hereby Given That a Public Hearing Will Be Held by The Tangipahoa Parish Council on Monday, July 13, 2020 at 5:30 PM At Tangipahoa Parish Government Building, 206 East Mulberry Street, Amite, Louisiana, contact number (985)748-3211, on the following:

- T.P. Ordinance No. 20-21- An ordinance placing a four-way stop sign at the intersection of Stafford Road, New Genessee Road and Pravata Lane in District No. 4 in Tangipahoa Parish in accordance with Chapter 20 streets, roads, sidewalks and drainage-Article I, in General- Section 20
- T.P. Ordinance No. 20-22-An ordinance placing 20 MPH speed limit signs on April Lane in District No. 2 in Tangipahoa Parish in accordance with Chapter 20 streets, roads, sidewalks and drainage- Article I, in General- Section 20
- T.P. Ordinance No. 20-23- An ordinance to authorize the Parish President or his authorized designee to execute any and all documents in regards to the donation of the properties list herein from the Louisiana Land Trust (Restore Louisiana buyout program)
- T.P. Ordinance No. 20-24- An ordinance to grant a variance to the Tangipahoa Parish Subdivision Regulations setback requirements for lots 34 and 35 of Milan Village Subdivision in District No. 8, Tangipahoa Parish, State of Louisiana
- T.P. Ordinance No. 20-25- An ordinance placing a moratorium on the consideration and/or preliminary approval through the Planning Commission for any new residential subdivisions with over 8 lots and special use residential commercial developments for a period of 60 days within Tangipahoa Parish South of Interstate 12

Tangipahoa Parish Council Tangipahoa Parish Government Building 206 East Mulberry Street, Amite, LA 70422 Regular Meeting Immediately Following Public Hearing July 13, 2020

CALL TO ORDER

INVOCATION

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE (All Veterans and active military, please render the proper salute)

ROLL CALL

<u>**CELL PHONES**</u> - Please Mute or Turn Off

ADOPTION OF MINUTES - Regular meeting June 22, 2020

PUBLIC INPUT - Anyone Wishing to Address Agenda Items Which Were Not on Public Hearing

PARISH PRESIDENT'S REPORT

- 1. Recognition of Graduating KEYS Alliance Members
- 2. Approval of Bid- Tangipahoa Parish Government Safe Room
- 3. COVID-19 Statutory and Regulation Waivers for TPG Housing Choice Voucher Program
- 4. Approval of an Intergovernmental Agreement Between the City of Hammond and the Tangipahoa Parish Government
- <u>5.</u> Approval of an Intergovernmental Agreement between Tangipahoa Parish Government and Tangipahoa Sewer District No.
 1 in regards to LCDBG Velma Sewer Grant Phase II

REGULAR BUSINESS

- 6. LSU Ag, SE Region Forestry/Wildlife- Programming Updates
- 7. Adoption of T.P. Ordinance No. 20-21- An ordinance placing a four-way stop sign at the intersection of Stafford Road, New Genessee Road and Pravata Lane in District No. 4 in Tangipahoa Parish in accordance with Chapter 20 streets, roads, sidewalks and drainage- Article I, in General- Section 20
- 8. Adoption of T.P. Ordinance No. 20-22-An ordinance placing 20 MPH speed limit signs on April Lane in District No. 2 in Tangipahoa Parish in accordance with Chapter 20 streets, roads, sidewalks and drainage- Article I, in General- Section 20
- 9. Adoption of T.P. Ordinance No. 20-23- An ordinance to authorize the Parish President or his authorized designee to execute any and all documents in regards to the donation of the properties list herein from the Louisiana Land Trust (Restore Louisiana buyout program)
- 10. Adoption of T.P. Ordinance No. 20-24- An ordinance to grant a variance to the Tangipahoa Parish Subdivision Regulations setback requirements for lots 34 and 35 of Milan Village Subdivision in District No. 8, Tangipahoa Parish, State of Louisiana
- 11. Adoption of T.P. Ordinance No. 20-25- An ordinance placing a moratorium on the consideration and/or preliminary approval through the Planning Commission for any new residential subdivisions with over 8 lots and special use residential commercial developments for a period of 60 days within Tangipahoa Parish South of Interstate 12

- 12. Introduction of T.P. Ordinance No. 20-26- An ordinance to authorize the Tangipahoa Parish Council- President Government to accept a donation of immovable property from TPI Properties, LLC. c/o John Pate on Old Covington Highway and to authorize the Parish President or his authorized designee to sign any and all documents in regards to the acceptance of the aforementioned donation
- 13. Adoption of T.P. Resolution No. R20-15- A resolution authorizing the establishment of one or more deposit accounts at First Guaranty Bank on behalf of Tangipahoa Parish Government for the deposit of public funds; providing the Parish President to designate authorized person(s) to act on such accounts
- 14. Adoption of T.P. Resolution No. R20-16- A Resolution authorizing Hammond Area Recreation District No. 1 of the Parish of Tangipahoa, State of Louisiana to proceed with the issuance, sale and delivery of its not to exceed \$7,750,000 Limited Tax Revenue Refunding Bonds, in one or more series
- 15. Adoption of T.P. Resolution No. R20-17- A resolution to urge and request all Departments within the Parish of Tangipahoa to utilize every available avenue and resource to promote and encourage response to the 2020 federal decennial census
- 16. Appoint/Re-Appoint Tangipahoa Gravity Drainage District No. 5

BEER, WINE, AND LIQUOR PERMITS

LEGAL MATTERS

COUNCILMEN'S PRIVILEGES

ADJOURN

Kristen Pecararo Clerk of Council

Daily Star Please Publish July 9, 2020

Posted @ T.P. Courthouse Annex July 9, 2020

In Accordance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, If You Need Special Assistance, please contact <u>Kristen Pecararo</u> at <u>985-748-3211</u> describing the Assistance that is necessary.

June 23, 2020

Tangipahoa Parish Government 206 East Mulberry St. Amite, LA 70422

Attn: Melissa Cowart

RE: TPG HMGP Hurricane Safe Room – Hammond H/S Project No. 16036 Bid Tabulation

Dear Ms. Cowart:

Pursuant to the bid opening for the above referenced project that occurred on June 17, 2020, the apparent low bidder CM Combs Construction, LLC has confirmed their bid amount and has provided their Attestations and Non-Collusion Affidavits as required by Public Bid Law. The following documents are attached for your use and file:

- Bid Tabulation
- CM Combs Construction Attestations Affidavit form (LA RS-38:2227, LA RS-38:2212.10, LA RS-23:1726(B))
- CM Combs Construction Non-Collusion Affidavit form (LA RS-38:2224)

In consideration of the above, we recommend award of the project to CM Combs Construction, LLC in the amount of \$747,000.00.

Should you have any questions regarding the enclosed, please do not hesitate to contact our office.

Sincerely,

HOLLY & SMITH ARCHITECTS A Professional Architectural Corporation

R. Ryan Faull, AIA

Architect

RRF/rbg

Enclosures

H/S

HOLLY & SMITH ARCHITECTS

.

Bid Tabulation

Tangipahoa Parish Government Safe Room H/S Project No.: 16036

June 17, 2020 at 2:00 PM

÷

| Addendum | 2 Base Bid | - No Bid | \$819,000.00 | - No Bid | - No Bid | \$769,000.00 | \$797,000.00 | - No Bid | \$959,075.00 | \$960,000.00 | \$747,000.00 | | | |
|----------|-------------|-------------------------|------------------|---|---------------------------------|--------------------------|--------------------------|--------------------------------|-----------------------------|---------------------------|----------------------------|--|--|--|
| 1000 | d 1 | 1 | > | 1 | 8 | > | > | | > | > | > | | | |
| Bid | Bond | , | > | | V 1 | > | > | × | > | > | > | | | |
| | License No. | 35232 | 33973 | 40689 | 42259 | 6328 | 43263 | 34263 | 36961 | 43152 | 55237 | | | |
| | Contractor | Kent Design Build, Inc. | SBS Construction | Stuart and Company General Contractors, LLC | D & H Quality Construction, LLC | Brunt Construction, Inc. | Sienna Construction, LLC | LA Contracting Enterprise, LLC | Cycle Construction Co., LLC | Deumite Construction, LLC | CM Combs Construction, LLC | | | |

HOLLY AND SMITH ARCHITECTS, APAC / 208 N CATE ST. / HAMMOND, LA 70401 / TEL 985.35.5210 / FAX 985.345.5297 / HOLLYANDSMITH.COM

COVID-19 STATUTORY AND REGULATORY WAIVERS FOR TANGIPAHOA PARISH GOVERNMENT HOUSING CHOICE VOUCHER PROGRAM

Pursuant to the authority provided under the Coronavirus Aid, Relief and Economic Security (CARES) Act, HUD is waiving and establishing alternative requirements for numerous statutory and regulatory requirements for the Housing Choice Voucher Program effective April 10, 2020.

As a result of the waivers that have been established by HUD the Tangipahoa Parish Government Housing Choice Vouchers will adopt the following Waivers into their administration policy. The period of availability for these waivers/alternative requirements, collectively or individually, may be extended by PIH notice should HUD determine this to be necessary.

<u>PH AND HCV #1 – PHA 5-YEAR AND ANNUAL PLAN SUBMISSION DATES,</u> <u>SIGNIFICANT AMENDMENT REQUIREMENTS</u>

Statutory Authority: Section 5A(a)(1), Section 5A(b)(1), Section 5A(g) and Section 5A(h)(2) of the United States Housing Act of 1937(hereafter "the USHA of 1937")

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR903.5(a)(3);903.5(b)(3), 903.21

HUD is waiving these requirements and establishing an alternative requirement that any change to a PHA policy, except for changes related to Section 18, Section 22, or the Rental Assistance Demonstration (RAD), that would normally trigger significant amendment requirements of the PHA Plan, may be effectuated without completing the significant amendment process.

Period of Availability: The period of availability for the waiver of the significant amendment process ends on July 31, 2020. The period of availability for the 5-Year /Annual Plan submission varies depending on the end date of the PHA fiscal year.

<u>PHA AND HCV #2 – FAMILY INCOME AND COMPOSITION: DELAYED ANNUAL</u> <u>EXAMINATIONS</u>

Statutory Authority: Section 3(a)(1) of the USHA of 1937

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.516 (a) (1)

Period of Availability: All annual recertifications due in Calendar Year (CY) 2020 must be completed by December 31, 2020.

<u>PH AND HCV #3 – FAMILY INCOME AND COMPOSTION: ANNUAL</u> <u>EXAMINATION-INCOME VERIFICATION REQUIREMENTS</u>

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 5.233 (a) (2) Sub-regulatory Guidance: PIH Notice 2018-18

HUD is waiving the requirements to use the income hierarchy described by PIH Notice 2018-18 and will allow PHA's to forgo third-party income verification requirements for annual reexaminations, including the use of EIV, if the PHA wishes to conduct the annual recertification rather than delaying the family's annual recertification.

Period of Availability: The period of availability to conduct annual reexaminations using these modified verification requirements end on July 31, 2020.

<u>PH AND HCV #4 – FAMILY INCOME AND COMPOSTION: INTERIM</u> <u>EXAMINATIONS</u>

Statutory Authority: Section 3(a)(1) of the USHA of 1937

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 5.233 (a) (2) – HCV/PUBLIC HOUSING 24 CFR982.516 © (2) - HCV

HUD is waiving the requirements to use the income verification hierarchy as described by PIH Notice 2018-18.

Period of Availability: The period of availability ends on July 31, 2020.

PH AND HCV #5 – ENTERPRISE INCOME VERIFICATION (EIV) MONITORING

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 5.233 Sub-regulatory Guidance: PIH Notice 2018-18

HUD is waiving the mandatory EIV monitoring requirements.

Period of Availability: The period of availability ends on July 31, 2020.

PH AND HCV #7- WAITING LIST: OPENING AND CLOSING: PUBLIC NOTICE

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.206 (a) (2) Sub-regulatory Guidance: PIH Notice 2012-34 HUD is waving this requirement and is providing an alternative requirement that the PHA may provide public notice in a voicemail message on its main or general information telephone number and through its website.

Period of Availability: The period of availability ends on July 31, 2020.

PH AND HCV #8- HOUSING QUALITY STANDARDS (HQS) INSPECTIONS

HUD recognizes the unprecedented challenge the COVID-19 pandemic poses to PHA's in carry out the most essential of their HCV program administrative responsibilities – ensuring that assisted families are living in decent, safe, and sanitary housing. However, conducting physical inspections of units in many communities during the national emergency poses its own health risks for families, participating owners, and PHA personnel, and may run counter to public health orders, directive, or recommendations such as shelter-in-place or other social distancing practices designed to contain and reduce exposure to COVID-19.

PHA's that apply these waivers to its HCV program retains the right to conduct an HQS inspection on any assisted unit at any time.

Period of Availability: The PHA is required to conduct an HQS inspection on the unit as soon as reasonably possible but no later than October 31, 2020.

HQS -1: INITIAL INSPECTION REQUIREMENTS

Statutory Authority: Section 8 (o)(8)(A)(i), Section 8(o)(8)(C) of the USHA of 1937 Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.305(a), 982.305(b), 982.405

HUD is waving these requirements and providing an alternative requirement.

The PHA may rely on the owner's recertification that the owner has no reasonable basis to have knowledge that life-threatening conditions exist in the unit or units in question instead of conducting an initial inspection.

Period of Availability: The period of availability for PHA's to accept owner's self-certification for an initial inspection ends on July 31, 2020. The period of availability for the PHA to inspect a unit that was placed under HAP contract based on the owner's self-certification ends on October 31, 2020.

HQS -3: INITIAL INSPECTION: NON-LIFE-THREATENING DEFICIENCIES (NLT) OPTION

Statutory Authority: Section 8(0)(8)(A)(ii) of the USHA of 1937 Regulatory Authority: Housing Opportunity Through Modernization Act (HOTMA) of 2016; Implementation of Various Section 8 Voucher Provisions, 82 Fed. Reg. 5458 (Jan. 18, 2017)

HUD is waiving the requirement that the PHA must withhold the payment if the NLT repairs are not made in 30 days.

The PHA may provide an extension of up to an additional 30 days to the owner to make the NLT repairs and continue to make payments to the owner during the period of that maximum 30 -day extension.

Period of Availability: The period of availability for the PHA to approve an extension of up to an additional 30 days ends on July 31, 2020.

HQS-4: HQS INITIAL INSPECTION REQUIREMENT – ALTERNATIVE INSPECTION OPTION

Statutory Authority: Section 8(o) (D) of the USHA of 1937 Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.405(a), 983.103(d)

HUD is waiving the requirement and allowing PHA's to delay biennial inspections for both tenant-based and PBV units.

Period of Availability: The period of availability ends on October 31, 2020.

HQS-6: HQS INTERIM INSPECTIONS

Statutory Authority: Section 8(o) (8) (f) of the USHA of 1937 Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.405(g), 983.103(e)

HUD is waving these requirements and establishing an alternative requirement for both tenantbased and PBV units.

Period of Availability: The period of availability ends on July 31, 2020.

HQS-9: HQS QUALITY CONTROL INSPECTIONS

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.405(b)

HUD is waiving this requirement to conduct supervisory quality control inspections of a sampling of units under contract.

Period of Availability: The period of availability ends on October 31, 2020.

HQS-10: HOUSING QUALITY STANDARDS: SPACE AND SECURITY

Regulatory Authority 982.401 (d)

HUD is waiving this requirement for PHA's where the PHA wishes to assist a current participant that needs to add a member or members to the assisted household as a result of the COVID-19 emergency, and the additional family members would result in the unit not meeting the space and security standards.

Period of Availability: This waiver will be in effect for the duration of the current lease term or one year from the date of this notice, whichever period of time is longer.

9- HOUSING CHOICE VOUCHER PROGRAM WAIVERS – GENERAL

HCV-1: ADMINISTRATION PLAN

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.54 (a)

HUD is waving the requirement to allow the PHA administrative plan to be revised on a temporary basis without Board Approval.

Period of Availability: The period of availability ends on July 31, 2020.

HCV-2: Information When Family is Selected – PHA Oral Briefing

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.301 (a) (3), 983.252(a)

HUD is waiving this requirement and as an alternative requirement allowing PHA to conduct the briefing by other means such as webcast, video call, or expanded information packet.

Period of Availability: The period of availability ends on July 31, 2020.

HCV-3: Term of Voucher – Extension of Term

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.303(b) (1)

HUD is waiving the requirement that the extension(s) must be accordance with the PHA's administrative plan in order to allow the PHA to provide extensions even though it has been unable to formally amend its policy in the administrative plan.

Period of Availability: The period of availability ends on July 31, 2020.

HCV-4: PHA Approval of Assisted Tenancy-When HAP Contract is Executed

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.305

HUD is waiving the regulatory requirement to allow PHAs to execute the HAP contract after the 60 day deadline has passed and make housing assistance payments back to the beginning of the lease term.

Period of Availability: The period of availability to execute the HAP contract after the normally 60-day period from the beginning of the lease term ends on July 31, 2020.

HCV-5: Absence from Unit

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.312

HUD is waiving this regulatory requirement to allow the PHA at its discretion to continue housing assistance payments and not terminate the HAP contract due to extenuating circumstances (e.g., hospitalization, extended stays at nursing homes, caring for family members).

Period of Availability: The period of availability for the PHA to choose to continue making HAP payments despite the family's absence of more than 180 consecutive days ends on December 31, 2020.

HCV-6: Automatic Termination of HAP contract

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.455

PHAs are required by this regulation to automatically terminate HAP contracts 180 days after the last housing assistance payment to the owner. In recognition that the COVID-19 emergency is creating economic and employment instability for many families, as well as situations where families may on a temporary basis be adding members whose additional income may result in a \$0 HAP subsidy calculation, HUD is waving this requirement.

Period of Availability: The period of availability for the extension ends December 31, 2020.

HCV-7: Increase in payment standard under HAP contract term

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.505 (c) (4)

HUD is waiving this requirement and as an alternative requirement allowing the PHAs to apply the increased payment standard at any time after the effective date of the increase in the payment standard amount, provided the increased payment standard is used to calculate the HAP no later than the effective date of the family's first regular reexamination following the change.

Period of Availability: The period of availability ends on December 31, 2020.

HCV-8: Utility Allowance Schedule – required review and extension

Regulatory Authority: 24 CFR 982.517

HUD is waving this requirement to allow PHAs to delay the review and update of utility allowances.

Period of Availability: Any review and update of utility allowance that were due at some point in time in CY 2020 must be completed no later than December 31, 2020.

INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT

STATE OF LOUISIANA PARISH OF TANGIPAHOA

THIS AGREEMANT is made and entered into on the _____ day of _____ Between the Tangipahoa Parish Government, represented herein by it's president, Robby Miller, who is duly authorized as a part of his regular duty to execute this agreement and the <u>City of</u> <u>Hammond</u> represented herein by Mayor Pete Panepinto who is duly authorized to execute this document as a part of his regular duty.

WITNESSETH

Tangipahoa Parish Government will provide certain services for the above named municipality, which service shall be: **Repairing and overlaying a section of roadway on Whitmar Drive located in Whitmar Acres Subdivision.**

These services will be performed only within the corporate limits of the above named municipality at a cost of \$22,000.00. It is understood that the City of Hammond will pay 50% of the cost for this service. **Thus done and signed** on the above written date.

Robby Miller, Parish President

Pete Panepinto, Mayor

INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE TANGIPAHOA PARISH GOVERNMENT AND THE SEWERAGE DISTRICT NO. 1 OF THE PARISH OF TANGIPAHOA

STATE OF LOUISIANA

This Intergovernmental Agreement (IGA) is made and entered into this _____ day of ______, 2020 by and between the TANGIPAHOA PARISH GOVERNMENT (Parish), a political subdivision of the State of Louisiana, domiciled in Tangipahoa Parish, Louisiana, herein represented by the Tangipahoa Parish President, Robby Miller, and the SEWERAGE DISTRICT NO. 1 OF THE PARISH OF TANGIPAHOA (the Sewer District), a political subdivision of the State of Louisiana, domiciled in Tangipahoa Parish, Louisiana, herein represented by its Manager, Jason Hood.

The Parish and the Sewer District agree as follows:

WHEREAS, Article VII, Section 14(C) of the Constitution of the State of Louisiana provides that for a public purpose, the State of Louisiana and its political subdivisions or political corporations may engage in co-operative endeavors with each other, with the United States of America or it agencies or with any public or private association, corporation or individual;

WHEREAS, the Parish and the Sewer District desire to cooperate in the manner as hereinafter provided;

WHEREAS, both the Parish and the Sewer District have a duty and obligation to the citizens of Tangipahoa Parish, Louisiana; and

WHEREAS, the Parish has received a Louisiana Community Development Block Grant to complete construction of the Velma Sewer Collection System Improvements in the jurisdiction of SEWERAGE DISTRICT NO. 1 of the PARISH OF TANGIPAHOA. All of the said project is in the jurisdiction of the TANGIPAHOA PARISH GOVERNMENT.

WHEREAS, the funding of this grant is reserved for activities outlined in the Parish's LCDBG application as being related to the project and grant program goals of providing sewer collection services in the Velma area.

WHEREAS, the actions and services required of the Parish and the Sewer District pursuant to this agreement will result in a public benefit to citizens of Tangipahoa Parish and the Sewer District, as described herein and are not disproportionate to the investment of either the Parish or the Sewer District; and

WHEREAS, this agreement is in the best interests of both the and the Sewer District.

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual covenants and agreements

Page 2 of 5

herein contained for the public purpose and the public benefit, the parties hereto each agree and covenant as follows:

SCOPE OF SERVICES

The TANGIPAHOA PARISH GOVERNMENT agrees and hereby covenants as follows:

The Parish, as the grant recipient for such funds, does hereby assume responsibility for the proper administration, implementation and payment for the said project in conformity with and under the authority of the Louisiana Division of Administration, Community Development Block Grant Program.

The SEWERAGE DISTRICT NO. 1 OF THE PARISH OF TANGIPAHOA agrees and hereby covenants, and contracts as follows:

The Sewer District does hereby agree and authorize the Parish to construct said project in accordance with the plans and specifications prepared by Spangler Engineering, LLC, and to use the available land and rights of way as owned by the TANGIPAHOA PARISH GOVERNMENT.

The Parish shall transfer ownership of the project to the SEWERAGE DISTRICT NO. 1 of the PARISH OF TANGIPAHOA only on the condition that said Sewer District shall agree to properly operate and maintain said project in accordance with the terms and geographical boundaries as specified in the application approved on behalf of the TANGIPAHOA PARISH GOVERNMENT.

Specifically, the transfer of ownership shall be limited to the following property and items, to wit: sewer infrastructure and any property acquired to complete the project as described in the Velma Sewer Collection System Improvements project plans and specifications.

The Sewer District also agrees that the items or property listed above will not be transferred between districts or disposed of without LCDBG permission and complying with Federal Regulations concerning disposition of property purchased with LCDBG Funds. (24 CFR, Chap. V, Para. 570.489)

The District further agrees to absolve the Parish government from any liability or responsibility as regards to the improvements and will provide written acceptances of the project to the Parish when construction is completed.

The District is responsible for the design or the proposed sewer improvements and will pay the cost of any design work, environmental permits, and construction inspection.

ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF RELATIONSHIP

The parties agree and acknowledge that they are cooperating partners, each with certain duties and responsibilities, in this grant project and that each party will take all necessary and proper actions to assure the success of this project.

Page 3 of 5 PROJECT COST EXCEED GRANT FUNDS

In the event that the parties determine that the price and cost of the project will exceed the amount granted for this project, then the Sewer District will cover cost overruns. In no case shall the Parish be liable or responsible for any pay for a cost overrun in excess of the project grant funds.

TERM OF AGREEMENT

This agreement shall begin on the effective date of this IGA and will terminate on the date that the project has been completed and the project approved by the Sewer District.

TERMINATION CLAUSE

Either party may terminate this agreement for cause based upon the failure of the other party to comply with the terms and/or conditions of this IGA provided that the aggrieved party shall give the other party written notice specifying the other party's failure. If within thirty (30) days after receipt of such notice, the offending party shall not have corrected such failure and thereafter proceeded diligently to complete such correction, then the aggrieved party may, at its option, place the other party in default and the agreement shall terminate on the date specified in such notice. Either party may exercise any rights available to it under Louisiana law to terminate for cause upon the failure of the other party to comply with the terms and conditions of this agreement; provided that the aggrieved party shall give the other party written notice specifying the other party's failure and a reasonable opportunity for the other party to cure the defect.

<u>OWNERSHIP</u>

All records, reports, documents and other material delivered or transmitted to one party by the other party shall remain the property of the original owner and shall be returned by the other party to the original owner at the other party's expense at termination or expiration of this agreement. All records, reports, documents, or other material related to this agreement and/or obtained or prepared by either party in connection with the performance of that party's obligation shall become the property of that party and shall, upon request, be returned by other party to the original owner at the termination or expiration of this agreement. The above and foregoing notwithstanding, each party shall be entitled to maintain its own copies of all records, reports, documents or other material related to this agreement.

NONASSIGNABILITY

Neither party to this agreement shall assign any interest or duty to any third party without the prior written consent of the other.

MEDIATION CLAUSE

It is agreed to by both parties that the 21st Judicial Court shall at all times have both the right and option of mediating this agreement or the terms thereof.

SEVERABILITY

If any term, covenant, condition or provision of this agreement or the application thereof to any person or circumstance shall at any time or to any extent be invalid or unenforceable, the persons or circumstances other than those as to which it is held invalid or unenforceable, shall be unaffected thereby and each such term, covenant, condition and provision of this agreement shall be valid and be enforced to the fullest extent permitted by law.

ENTIRE AGREEMENT/MODIFICATION

This agreement contains the entire agreement between the parties and supersedes any and all agreements or contracts previously entered into between the parties. No representations were made or relied upon by either party, other than those that are expressly set forth herein. This agreement may be modified or amended at any time by mutual consent of the parties, provided that, before any modification or amendment shall be operative and valid, it shall be reduced to writing and signed by both parties.

DISCRIMINATION CLAUSE

The parties agree not to discriminate in their employment practices and will render services under this Agreement without regard to race, color, religion, sex, national origin, veteran status, political affiliation, disabilities.

LEGAL COMPLIANCE

The parties shall each comply with all federal, state and local laws and regulations, including specifically the Louisiana Code of Governmental Ethics and State procurement standards, in carrying out the provisions of this agreement.

REMEDIES FOR DEFAULT

In addition to any remedy provided for herein, in the event of default by either party, the aggrieved party shall have all rights granted by the general laws of the State of Louisiana.

NOTICES

All notices and other communications pertaining to this agreement shall be in writing and shall be transmitted either by personal hand delivery and receipted for or shall be deposited in the United States Mail, as certified mail, return receipt requested and postage prepaid, to the other party, addressed as follows:

Tangipahoa Parish Council-President Government Attn: Robby Miller, President Post Office Box 215 Amite, Louisiana 70422

Sewerage District No. 1 of the Parish of Tangipahoa: Attn: Jason Hood, Manager Sewerage District No. 1 of the Parish of Tangipahoa 15485 West Club Deluxe Road Hammond, La. 70403 IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this agreement in duplicate original on the date as first written above at Amite, Tangipahoa Parish, Louisiana.

| WITNESSES: | TANGIPAHOA PARISH GOVERNMENT |
|--------------|---|
| (Print Name) | Robby Miller Tangipahoa Parish President |
| | _ SEWERAGE DISTRICT NO. 1 of the PARISH OF TANGIPAHOA |
| (Print Name) | Jason Hood, Manager Sewerage District No. 1 of the Parish of |

Tangipahoa

5

AN ORDINANCE PLACING A 4-WAY STOP SIGN AT THE INTERSECTION OF STAFFORD ROAD, NEW GENESSEE ROAD AND PRAVATA LANE IN DISTRICT NO. 4 IN TANGIPAHOA PARISH IN ACCORDANCE WITH CHAPTER 20, STREETS, ROADS, SIDEWALKS AND DRAINAGE - ARTICLE I, IN GENERAL -SECTION 20-16

BE IT ORDAINED by the Tangipahoa Parish Council, governing authority of Tangipahoa Parish, State of Louisiana, as follows:

1) A 4-Way stop sign at the intersection of Stafford Road, New Genessee Road and Pravata Lane in District No. 4

in Accordance With Chapter 20, Streets, Roads, Sidewalks And Drainage - Article I, in General - Section 20-16.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this ordinance shall become effective immediately upon signature of the Parish President and all previous ordinances in conflict with said ordinance are hereby repealed.

The above and foregoing ordinance having been duly submitted to the Tangipahoa Parish Council in writing; introduced at a public meeting of the Tangipahoa Parish Council; discussed at the said public hearing; after motion and second was submitted to the official vote of the Tangipahoa Parish Council.

On motion by ______and seconded by ______, the foregoing resolution was hereby declared adopted on this the 13th day of July, 2020 by the following roll-call vote:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

NOT VOTING:

ABSTAIN:

| Kristen Pecararo, Clerl Tangipahoa Parish Cou | S. Bruno, Chairman bahoa Parish Council | | |
|--|--|-----------------------|-------------|
| INTRODUCED: | June 22, 2020 | | |
| PUBLISHED: | July 9, 2020 | The Daily Star- OFFIC | TAL JOURNAL |
| ADOPTED BY TPC: | July 13, 2020 | | |
| DELIVERED TO PRE | SIDENT: | day of July, 2020 at | PM |
| APPROVED BY PRE | SIDENT: | Miller | Date |
| VETOED BY PRESID | DENT: Robby | Miller | Date |
| RECEIVED FROM PI | RESIDENT: | day of July, 2020 at | PM |

AN ORDINANCE PLACING 20 MPH SPEED LIMIT SIGNS ON APRIL LANE IN DISTRICT NO. 2 IN TANGIPAHOA PARISH IN ACCORDANCE WITH CHAPTER 20, STREETS, ROADS, SIDEWALKS AND DRAINAGE - ARTICLE I, IN GENERAL -SECTION 20-16

BE IT ORDAINED by the Tangipahoa Parish Council, governing authority of Tangipahoa Parish, State of Louisiana, as follows:

1) 20 MPH Speed Limit signs on April Lane in District No. 2

in Accordance with Chapter 20, Streets, Roads, Sidewalks and Drainage - Article I, in General - Section 20-16.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this ordinance shall become effective immediately upon signature of the Parish President and all previous ordinances in conflict with said ordinance are hereby repealed.

The above and foregoing ordinance having been duly submitted to the Tangipahoa Parish Council in writing; introduced at a public meeting of the Tangipahoa Parish Council; discussed at the said public hearing; after motion and second was submitted to the official vote of the Tangipahoa Parish Council.

On motion by ______and seconded by ______, the foregoing resolution was hereby declared adopted on this the 13th day of July, 2020 by the following roll-call vote:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

NOT VOTING:

ABSTAIN:

| Kristen Pecararo, Clerk Tangipahoa Parish Cou | | | Carlo S. Bruno, Chairman Tangipahoa Parish Council | | | |
|--|----------------------|---------------------------------|---|--|--|--|
| INTRODUCED: | June 22, 2020 | | | | | |
| PUBLISHED: | July 9, 2020 | The Daily Star- OFFICIAL JOURNA | | | | |
| ADOPTED BY TPC: | | | | | | |
| DELIVERED TO PRE | day of July, 2020 at | PM | | | | |
| APPROVED BY PRES | Date | | | | | |
| VETOED BY PRESID | | by Miller | Date | | | |
| RECEIVED FROM PR | ESIDENT: | day of July, 2020 at | PM | | | |

AN ORDINANCE TO AUTHORIZE THE PARISH PRESIDENT OR HIS AUTHORIZED DESIGNEE TO EXECUTE ANY AND ALL DOCUMENTS IN REGARDS TO THE DONATION OF THE PROPERTIES LISTED HEREIN FROM THE LOUISIANA LAND TRUST (RESTORE LOUISIANA BUYOUT PROGAM)

BE IT ORDAINED by the Tangipahoa Parish Council-President Government, governing authority of Tangipahoa Parish, State of Louisiana that the action of Tangipahoa Parish President or his authorized designee is hereby authorized to execute all documents in regards to the donation of the following properties through the Louisiana Land Trust (Restore Louisiana buyout program):

- 1. 16092 E. Paradise Park Lane, Independence
- 2. 22357 Brignac Road, Robert
- 3. 25156 Highway 190 East, Robert
- 4. 16155 E. Paradise Park Lane, Independence

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this ordinance shall become effective immediately upon adoption of the TPC and signature of the Parish President.

On motion by ______ and seconded by ______ the foregoing resolution was hereby declared adopted on this the 13th day of July, 2020 by the following roll-call vote:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

NOT VOTING:

ABSTAIN:

| Kristen Pecararo, C Tangipahoa Parish | | Carlo S. Bruno, Chairman Tangipahoa Parish Council | | | |
|--|--------------------------|---|------|--|--|
| INTRODUCED: | June 22, 2020 | | | | |
| PUBLISHED: | The Daily Star- OFFICIAI | L JOURNAL | | | |
| ADOPTED BY TP | C: July 13, 2020 | | | | |
| DELIVERED TO P | PM | | | | |
| APPROVED BY P | | y Miller | Date | | |
| VETOED BY PRE | | y Miller | Date | | |
| RECEIVED FROM | PRESIDENT: | day of July. 2020 at | PM | | |

T. P. ORDINANCE NO. 20-24

AN ORDINANCE TO GRANT A VARIANCE TO THE TANGIPAHOA PARISH SUBDIVISION REGULATIONS SETBACK REQUIREMENTS FOR MR. HAROLD H. PERRILLOUX, JR. AND MRS. GINA PERRILLOUX FOR LOTS – 34 & 35 OF MILAN VILLAGE SUBDIVISION IN DISTRICT NO. 8, TANGIPAHOA PARISH, STATE OF LOUISIANA

WHEREAS, The Milan Village Subdivision was approved by the Tangipahoa Parish Planning Commission;

WHEREAS, Mr. and Mrs. Harold H. Perrilloux, Jr. are asking to vary from the approved plan by changing the front setback for lots 34 and 35 to allow a 20' setback;

WHEREAS, The parish's Community Development Office has no objection to the variance requested as it poses no issues with the utility servitude nor does it adversely affect the aesthetics of the subdivision as designed.

THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Tangipahoa Parish Council-President Government, governing authority of Tangipahoa Parish, State of Louisiana, that a variance to allow a 20' front setback is granted to Mr. and Mrs. Harold H. Perrilloux, Jr. for lots 34 and 35 of the Milan Village Subdivision.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that this ordinance shall become effective immediately upon signature of the Parish President.

This ordinance having been submitted in writing, having been introduced at a public meeting of the Tangipahoa Parish Council, discussed at a public hearing of said Council and was submitted to an official vote of the TPC.

On motion by ______ and seconded by ______, the foregoing resolution was hereby declared adopted on this the 13th day of July, 2020 by the following roll-call vote:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

NOT VOTING:

ABSTAIN:

| Kristen Pecararo, C Tangipahoa Parish | | | no, Chairman Parish Council |
|--|------------------|----------------------|--------------------------------|
| INTRODUCED: | June 22, 2020 | | |
| PUBLISHED: | JOURNAL | | |
| ADOPTED BY TP | C: July 13, 2020 | | |
| DELIVERED TO F | PRESIDENT: | day of July, 2020 at | PM |
| APPROVED BY P | | | |
| | Robby | y Miller | Date |
| VETOED BY PRE | SIDENT: | | |
| | Robb | y Miller | Date |
| RECEIVED FROM | I PRESIDENT: | day of July, 2020 at | PM |

T. P. ORDINANCE NO. 20-25

AN ORDINANCE TO PLACE A MORATORIUM ON THE CONSIDERATION AND/OR PRELIMINARY APPROVAL THROUGH THE PLANNING COMMISSION OF ANY NEW RESIDENTIAL SUBDIVISIONS WITH OVER 8 LOTS AND SPECIAL USE RESIDENTIAL COMMERICAL DEVELOPMENTS FOR A PERIOD OF 60 DAYS WITHIN TANGIPAHOA PARISH SOUTH OF INTERSTATE 12

WHEREAS, the Tangipahoa Parish Council seeks to protect the health and welfare of all citizens; and,

WHEREAS, the Tangipahoa Parish Council has the authority and responsibility to provide for the orderly and safe development of subdivisions in the Parish of Tangipahoa; and,

WHEREAS, the Parish of Tangipahoa in some critical regions, have been devastated by flooding that seems to be worsening; and,

WHEREAS, the Tangipahoa Parish Council-President Government desires to establish further regulations so as to ensure that these types of developments are well regulated, safe and properly maintained; and,

THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED by the Tangipahoa Parish Council, the governing authority of Tangipahoa Parish, State of Louisiana, that a moratorium be placed on the consideration and/or preliminary approval through the Planning Commission for any new residential subdivisions with over 8 lots and special use residential commercial developments for a period of 60 days within Tangipahoa Parish, South Interstate 12; and,

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this moratorium shall expire in 60 days from the adoption of this ordinance unless extended by Resolution of the Tangipahoa Parish Council.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this ordinance shall become effective immediately upon signature of the Parish President.

This ordinance having been submitted in writing, having been introduced at a public meeting of the Tangipahoa Parish Council, discussed at a public hearing of said Council and was submitted to an official vote of the TPC.

On motion by ______ and seconded by ______, the foregoing ordinance was hereby declared adopted on this 13th day of July, 2020 by the following roll-call vote:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

NOT VOTING:

ABSTAIN:

| Kristen Pecararo, Clerk Tangipahoa Parish Cou | | Carlo S. Bruno, Chairm Tangipahoa Parish Cour | |
|--|---------------|--|--|
| INTRODUCED: | June 22, 2020 | | |
| PUBLISHED: | July 9, 2020 | The Daily Star- OFFICIAL JOURNAL | |
| ADOPTED BY TPC: | July 13, 2020 | | |
| DELIVERED TO PRE | SIDENT: | day of July, 2020 atPM | |
| APPROVED BY PRES | SIDENT: | Tiller Date | |
| VETOED BY PRESID | ENT: Robby I | Ailler Date | |
| RECEIVED FROM PR | ESIDENT: | day of July, 2020 at PM | |

"AN ORDINANCE TO AUTHORIZE THE TANGIPAHOA PARISH COUNCIL-PRESIDENT GOVERNMENT TO ACCEPT A DONATION OF IMMOVABLE PROPERTY FROM **JOHN PATE** AND TO AUTHORIZE THE PARISH PRESIDENT OR HIS AUTHORIZED DESIGNEE TO SIGN ANY AND ALL DOCUMENTS IN REGARDS TO THE ACCEPTANCE OF THE AFOREMENTIONED DONATION"

WHEREAS, **JOHN PATE** has offered to donate to the Tangipahoa Parish Council-President Government a parcel of property being 60' strip of land in Section 28, Township 6 South-Range East

THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED by the Tangipahoa Parish Council, the legislative branch of parish government, which along with the Parish President of Tangipahoa Parish, Louisiana constitute the parish government, the said Tangipahoa Parish Council-President Government having a Home Rule form of government and acting pursuant to the authority of that Home Rule Charter which became effective on October 27, 1986 as follows:

That the Tangipahoa Parish President or his authorized designee as the representative of and for and on behalf of the Tangipahoa Parish Council-President Government, be and is hereby authorized, empowered and directed to accept from the donor, John Pate the following described parcel of property described as certain tract of land designated tract number 18 containing 2.026 acres on a boundary survey on the John Pate mini partition of Lot 1 of the Albert Torres lot line revision in Section 28, Township 6 South-Range East, as shown on the survey by Andrew N. Faller, P.L.S. dated July 1, 2020 being approximate 60' in width beginning at the edge of Old Covington Highway and traversing the property of John Pate as shown on said survey of south boundary of the tract is the Section line between Section 28 and section 33 6 South Range 8 East.

BE IT FURTHER OBTAINED that upon the acceptance of the donation of the hereinabove described property from the donor, John Pate, this property shall thereafter belong to and be owned in full fee simple ownership by the Tangipahoa Parish Council-President Government.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the Tangipahoa Parish Council that this ordinance shall take effect immediately upon the signature of the Tangipahoa Parish President.

The above and foregoing ordinance having been duly submitted to the Tangipahoa Parish Council in writing; introduced at a public meeting of the Tangipahoa Parish Council; discussed at a duly scheduled and noticed public hearing; after motion and second was submitted to the official vote of the Tangipahoa Parish Council.

On motion by ______ and seconded by ______, the foregoing ordinance was hereby declared adopted on this 27th day of July, 2020 by the following roll-call vote:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

NOT VOTING:

ABSTAIN:

| Kristen Pecararo, Clerk Tangipahoa Parish Cour | | Bruno, Chairman 10a Parish Council | | |
|---|---------------------------------------|---------------------------------------|----------------|--|
| INTRODUCED: | July 13, 2020 | | | |
| PUBLISHED: | July 23, 2020 | The Daily Star- OFFICIAI | FICIAL JOURNAL | |
| ADOPTED BY TPC: | July 27, 2020 | | | |
| DELIVERED TO PRES | SIDENT: | day of July, 2020 atP | М | |
| APPROVED BY PRES | · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · | Robby Miller | Date | |
| VETOED BY PRESIDE | | Robby Miller | Date | |
| RECEIVED FROM PR | ESIDENT: | day of July, 2020 at P | М | |

T.P. Resolution No. R20-15

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE ESTABLISHMENT OF ONE OR MORE DEPOSIT ACCOUNTS AT FIRST GUARANTY BANK ON BEHALF OF TANGIPAHOA PARISH GOVERNMENT FOR THE DEPOSIT OF PUBIC FUNDS; PROVIDING THE PARISH PRESIDENT TO DESIGNATE AUTHORIZED PERSON(S) TO ACT ON SUCH ACCOUNTS.

A resolution authorizing the establishment of one or more deposit accounts at First Guaranty Bank on behalf of Tangipahoa Parish Government for the deposit of public funds; providing for the Charles R. Miller, Jr. to designate authorized person(s) to act on such accounts; and providing for other matters in connection therewith.

WHEREAS, the Tangipahoa Parish Government, acting through its governing authority, the Tangipahoa Parish Council, pursuant to law, desires to provide for the deposit and disbursement of public funds held by Tangipahoa Parish Government in order to carry out its public functions; and

WHEREAS, the Tangipahoa Parish Government desires to establish one or more deposit accounts with First Guaranty Bank for this purpose.

SECTION 1. <u>Authorization</u>. One or more deposit accounts shall be established by Tangipahoa Parish Government with First Guaranty Bank for the deposit and disbursement of public funds to enable the Tangipahoa Parish Government to carry out its public functions.

SECTION 2. <u>Terms</u>. The Parish President be and (s)he is hereby authorized, empowered and directed to represent the Tangipahoa Parish Government in connection with said deposit accounts, which shall be on such terms and conditions as said Parish President, in his/her sole discretion, deems fit and proper.

SECTION 3. <u>Authorized Officers</u>. The Parish President is authorized to manage and operate said account(s), including but not limited to designate authorized signers on the account(s) to make deposits, sign and endorse checks and negotiable instruments on behalf of Tangipahoa Parish Government and withdraw or transfer funds from said account(s) as (s)he deems advisable; and to execute all documents in connection therewith and as (s)he may deem necessary to effect the transactions contemplated by this Resolution.

SECTION 4. <u>Effective Date</u>. This Resolution shall become effective immediately. All prior acts undertaken on behalf of Tangipahoa Parish Government with respect to deposit account(s) with First Guaranty Bank are ratified and confirmed.

[Remainder of this page intentionally left blank]

On motion by ______ and seconded by ______, the foregoing resolution was hereby adopted on this the 13^{th} day of July, 2020 by the following roll-call vote:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

NOT VOTING:

ATTEST:

Kristen Pecararo, Clerk of Council Tangipahoa Parish Council Carlo S. Bruno, Chairman Tangipahoa Parish Council

Robby Miller, President Tangipahoa Parish

T.P. RESOLUTION NO. R20-16

A Resolution authorizing Hammond Area Recreation District No. 1 of the Parish of Tangipahoa, State of Louisiana to proceed with the issuance, sale and delivery of its not to exceed \$7,750,000 Limited Tax Revenue Refunding Bonds, in one or more series.

WHEREAS, as required by Article VI, Section 15 of the Constitution of the State of Louisiana of 1974, as amended, and La. R.S. 33:1415, it is now the desire of the Parish Council, as the governing authority of the Parish of Tangipahoa, State of Louisiana (the "*Parish*") to approve the issuance and delivery of not to exceed \$7,750,000 Limited Tax Revenue Refunding Bonds, in one or more series (the "*Bonds*"), by Hammond Area Recreation District No. 1 of the Parish of Tangipahoa, State of Louisiana (the "*District*"), the proceeds of which will be used by the District to refund all or a portion of the District's outstanding (i) \$760,000 Limited Tax Revenue Bonds, Series 2011A (the "*Series 2011A Bonds*"), and (ii) \$8,911,000 Limited Tax Revenue Refunding Bonds, Series 2015 (the "*Series 2015 Bonds*").

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Parish Council, as the governing authority of the Parish:

SECTION 1. That, in compliance with the provisions of Article VI, Section 15 of the Constitution of the State of Louisiana of 1974, as amended, and La. R.S. 33:1415, and in accordance with the request of the Board of Commissioners of the District, the Parish Council approves the issuance and delivery of not to exceed \$7,750,000 Limited Tax Revenue Refunding Bonds of Hammond Area Recreation District No. 1 of the Parish of Tangipahoa, State of Louisiana, in one or more series. The Bonds shall bear interest at a fixed rate or rates not exceeding five percent (5.00%) per annum, shall mature no later than April 1, 2026, and shall be issued under the authority of Chapters 14 and 14-A of Title 39 of the Louisiana Revised Statutes of 1950, as amended, and other constitutional and statutory authority, or such other authority as may be determined by resolution of the District at the time of the issuance of the Bonds.

SECTION 2. The Parish President, the Council Chairman and the Council Clerk are hereby authorized and directed to do any and all things necessary and incidental to carry out the provisions of this Resolution and to assist the District in carrying out its functions in connection with the financing.

[Remainder of this page intentionally left blank]

On motion by ______ and seconded by ______, the foregoing Resolution was hereby declared adopted on this the 13th day of July, 2020 by the following roll-call vote:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

NOT VOTING:

ATTEST:

Carlo S. Bruno, Chairman Tangipahoa Parish Council

Kristen Pecararo, Clerk Tangipahoa Parish Council

> Robby Miller, President Tangipahoa Parish

STATE OF LOUISIANA PARISH OF TANGIPAHOA

I, the undersigned Clerk of the Parish Council of the Parish of Tangipahoa, State of Louisiana (the "*Parish Council*") do hereby certify that the foregoing constitutes a true and correct copy of a Resolution adopted by the Parish Council on July 13, 2020, authorizing Hammond Area Recreation District No. 1 of the Parish of Tangipahoa, State of Louisiana to proceed with the issuance, sale and delivery of its not to exceed \$7,750,000 Limited Tax Revenue Refunding Bonds, in one or more series.

IN FAITH WHEREOF, witness my official signature and the impress of the official seal of said Parish Council of the Parish of Tangipahoa, State of Louisiana, on this 13th day of July, 2020.

Kristen Pecararo, Clerk Tangipahoa Parish Council

[SEAL]

T.P. Resolution No. R20-17

A resolution to urge and request all Departments within the Parish of Tangipahoa to utilize every available avenue and resource to promote and encourage response to the 2020 federal decennial census.

WHEREAS, every ten years a complete and accurate count of every resident is required by Article I, Section 2 of the Constitution of the United States, and this required federal decennial census is conducted by the United State Bureau of the Census; and

WHEREAS, census data is used to distribute federal funding to local communities and to determine electoral representation, including the number of seats each state is allocated in the United States House of Representatives, all of which are critical to Louisiana and its residents; and

WHEREAS, more than three hundred federal programs rely on data derived from the census to guide the distribution of funds to states, parishes, municipalities and households, and the 2020 federal decennial census data will affect the allocation of approximately one and a half trillion dollars of federal funds; and

WHEREAS, even though invitations to respond to the 2020 federal decennial census were mailed in March of 2020 and Census Day was April 1, 2020, it is very disturbing that as of June 24, 2020, the self-response rate in the State of Louisiana was only 55.9% compared with the national average of 61.7%, and the Parish of Tangipahoa is 31st out of the 64 Parishes in Louisiana to respond; and

WHEREAS, it is estimated that every person in Louisiana who is not counted will cost Louisiana approximately three thousand two hundred dollars or more in lost federal funds; and

WHEREAS, due to the COVID-19 public health emergency, the United States Bureau of the Census has delayed the start of its non-response follow-up until August 11, 2020; and

WHEREAS, a significant amount of effort is required in order to achieve awareness of the importance of the 2020 federal decennial census and to obtain full participation and responses by all persons in Louisiana in the 2020 federal decennial census.

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Tangipahoa Parish Council does hereby urge and request all Departments within the Parish of Tangipahoa to utilize every available avenue and resource to promote and encourage response to the 2020 federal decennial census.

On motion by ______ and seconded by ______, the foregoing resolution was hereby adopted on this the 13th day of July, 2020 by the following roll-call vote:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

NOT VOTING:

ATTEST:

Kristen Pecararo, Clerk of Council Tangipahoa Parish Council Carlo S. Bruno, Chairman Tangipahoa Parish Council

Robby Miller, President Tangipahoa Parish

Gravity Drainage District No. 5

(4 year terms)

Contact: Mrs. Allyce Cutrer 985-969-0600

Meets 3rd Monday of month at 6:00pm at KW City Hall

| Commissioner | Appointed By | Term | Expiration |
|----------------------|----------------|----------------|------------|
| Ronald Robertson, Sr | 1 | 1 | July 2022 |
| 985-222-8982 | | | |
| Russ Carter | 1 | 1 | July 2022 |
| 985-514-3316 | | | |
| Steven Smith | 1 | 1 | July 2022 |
| 985-514-1586 | | | |
| Howard Magee | 1 | 1 | July 2024 |
| 985-514-2181 | | | |
| Ray Ydarraga | <mark>1</mark> | <mark>2</mark> | July 2020 |



P. O. BOX 2066 + HAMBLOND, LOUISLANA 70404 (905) 748-3231 + PAX (908) 748-0994 www.tangtyshine.org

TANGIPAHOA PARISH

| BOARD/COMMITTEE APPOINTEE INFORMATION | | | | | | | | |
|--|--|--|--|--|--|--|--|--|
| Name: Michael P. Kazerooni, Sr. | | | | | | | | |
| Board of Interest: Tangipahoa Parish Gr | of Interest Tangipahoa Parish Gravity Drainage District No.5 | | | | | | | |
| Physical Address: 723 Avenue E | Mailing Address: SAME | | | | | | | |
| Kentwood, La. 70444 | | | | | | | | |
| Hm No. (985) 6149807 | Cell No. (985) 6149807 | | | | | | | |
| E-Mail Address: michael.kazerooni@Kentwoodla.org | Occupation: Police Chief | | | | | | | |
| Years of Residence in Tangipahoa Parish 44 | | | | | | | | |
| Have you served on any Parish board/committee prev | vicanty? YES NO | | | | | | | |
| If Yes, what board/committee/s Tangipahoa Parish (| Gravity Drainage District No.5 | | | | | | | |
| Appointed by, Tom Tolar | | | | | | | | |
| By signing below, I certify that the foregoing inform X Michael Kagazor | ation is true and correct. | | | | | | | |

THENT FORMERT INFIDET

Lough Wats

COUNCIL LOUIN "NICK" JOHEPH DAVID P VIAL

CARLO S. BRUNO BROWNIE STOR H. O. "Report Room.